
VACCINE AWARENESS DATA 
& MEDICAL PRACTITIONER WAIVER

My guess is that there are three major classes of people who will read this article.

The first, and I hope the majority, will be those people who wonder about the safety and efficacy of 
vaccines, despite assurances from their doctor, the government and the vaccine makers. Maybe due 
to a post on social media, maybe because the hue and cry over normally mild childhood infections 
seems so vastly different from their own childhood experiences.

The second group are those who have enough data to know to question everything the government 
and doctors say and what manufacturers claim. Maybe due to personal experience with vaccines 
causing death or injury to a loved one or someone they know, maybe just due to them being aware 
that all that is written is not true. After all smoking tobacco, spraying DDT on your children, taking 
Thalidomide for morning sickness and taking Vioxx for arthritis were all deadly practices once 
approved if not actively promoted by their manufacturers and many doctors.

The third group of people who will read this will be those who are convinced of the vaccine mantra.
That vaccines have saved untold people from horrible afflictions, they are well and truly tested for 
safety and efficacy, have been found safe and are effective.

The challenge this group face in assimilating data so contrary to the mantra in which they fervently 
believe is it that requires a very dispassionate and objective ability to, if only temporarily, set aside 
close held beliefs in order to view facts, connect dots and arrive at their own conclusion.

When the contrary data threatens their livelihood or they perceive it makes them wrong (some 
people cannot STAND to be wrong, it nearly kills them) the contrary data is usually rejected 
wholesale and outright else it is nitpicked for any possible way that it could be criticised and 
rejected. Their actions are a bit like a lawyer, blind to truth and justice, seeking to dismiss a case for
procedural omission – like someone leaving off a full stop at the end of a sentence.

Given that much of the data herein comes from the likes of the US Supreme Court, the US Vaccine 
Injury Compensation Tribunal, US Food and Drug Administration, US Center for Disease Control,  
and independent researchers, most readers will be well satisfied with its bona fides.

But to this last group if you are not afflicted with the “must be right at all costs” disease and do not 
have a strong vested interest in maintaining a non-workable status quo then I ask you to first make a
brief list of what you presently know about vaccines and from who you obtained that data. This may
help you sort the chaff from the wheat as you read the referenced articles.

Apparently the drug company contributions to political parties are having the desired effect in 
swaying the politicians into denying their constituents the basic right to determine what health 
practices they employ for themselves and their children in favour of state mandated, one-size-fits-all
mass medication with vaccines.

So much so that the Maldives and Samoa and 5 US states have gone down the road of using force to
coerce vaccine compliance since a percentage of people will not willingly swallow the lies that 
contradict their own experience, data or logic. I sincerely hope it does not come to that but I have 
written the article in the sense that you are asking a medical practitioner to read this and sign the 
waiver on the last page.



I am aware that their manufacturers claim vaccines to be safe and effective and that that they also 
claim vaccines are responsible for vastly reduced death rates. I am aware that this and other vaccine 
information is put out by the manufacturers who have been fined billions of dollars for bribery, off 
label marketing and other fraudulent practices. I am aware that the prominent vaccine safety 
proponent, Robert F Kennedy Jr, refers to them as corporate felons.

Contrary to the data provided by the drug companies I am aware as indicated in the next image, that
the death rate for infectious childhood diseases fell by as much as 96% in the twentieth century 
PRIOR to the introduction of vaccines. I am aware that this spectacular drop in the death rate was 
due to better nutrition and sanitation, not vaccines.

THE TRUTH ABOUT THE GERM THEORY OF DISEASE
I am aware of the work of German scientist Dr. Stefan Lanka who began his pursuit of exposing the 
germ theory as a false dogma (which proposes that infected humans pass the pathogenic microbes 



to infect others) after experimenting with a virus he had isolated, then put into seawater, and 
observed how it influenced life positively.

Dr. Lanka claimed there is no measles virus and said he would award 100,000 Euros to any scientist
who would successfully prove otherwise. A Dr. David Barnards claimed the prize, Dr Lank refused 
to pay it so they went to court. Dr. Barnards won that case  so Dr Lanka appealed.

On appeal, the decision of the German Federal Supreme Court (BGH) presided over by a panel of 
judges, overturned the earlier lower court decision, was that there was not enough evidence to 
support the existence of a measles virus after five experts called upon concluded that none of the six
scientific papers introduced as evidence for the plaintiff proved evidence of a measles virus from 
the scientific literature. This was confirmed independently by German laboratories.

The legal results prove that the authors of the six publications in the measles virus case were wrong,
and as a direct result all measles virologists are still wrong today, mostly because the original 
researchers did not run control experiments. 

They had misinterpreted ordinary constituents of cells as part of the suspected measles virus and 
created a composite viral model from separate electron microscopic analyses. The final composite 
could not be recreated or found in any animal or human. According to Dr. Lanka, this is a common 
error in the field of virology that attempts to determine pathogenic viruses.

VACCINES ARE UNTESTED
I am aware that the 1980s US legislation exempting vaccine manufacturers from liability also 
required the US Health and Human Services Department to conduct regular safety tests of vaccines 
and that in 2019, Robert F Kennedy Jr filed a Freedom of Information request that uncovered no 
such testing had ever been conducted by that department. So the claim that vaccines have been 
tested for safety is erroneous. https://healthimpactnews.com/2018/hhs-sued-for-not-upholding-
vaccine-safety-testing-mandated-by-law/ 

I am aware that vaccine makers are exempt from applying the same testing standards to vaccines as 
drugs as by US law vaccines are not classified as drugs. Consequently no long-term double blind, 
trials against an inert placebo have been conducted.

I am aware that vaccine manufacturers will often conduct short term trials of a vaccine but not 
against an inert placebo but against adjuvants which are already known toxins. That has the effect of
making the destructive effects of the vaccine. I am aware that while no study has ever been done of 
the results of administering multiple vaccines at one time, many parents bury dead babies who were
fine and healthy before the administration of multiple vaccines.

VACCINES CONTAIN TOXINS
I am aware that vaccines contain many substances toxic to the body. These are listed on the vaccine 
inserts. http://www.vaccinesafety.edu/package_inserts.htm 

I am aware that one toxin is Thimerosal containing mercury on which one safety study was done 
that killed all 22 participants, most within a day.  https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=IiUDr9zFp94 

I am aware of MIT Professor Stephanie Seneff’s research proving that the toxins in vaccines 
interact with glyphosate to cause autism: “I have been searching for environmental causes of autism
for over a decade, and I now believe that I have identified the key toxic environmental factors that 
are causal in the epidemic. The most significant factor is glyphosate, the active ingredient in the 
herbicide Roundup. What makes glyphosate so dangerous is that it is pervasive, cumulatively 
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insidiously toxic, and widely believed to be nearly harmless to humans. Glyphosate collaborates 
with toxic components in vaccines to destroy neurons. These include, primarily, aluminium, 
mercury and glutamate. While glyphosate contamination in the food sets up a leaky gut barrier and 
leaky brain barrier, glyphosate contamination in many vaccines is ominous and likely catastrophic. 
In this talk, I will present the hard-core scientific evidence for the complex metabolic cascade these 
toxic metals and chemicals induce, beginning with disruption of gut microbes, bile acids, and 
digestive enzymes, and ending with a devastating neurological disability.” Stephanie Seneff, BS, 
MS, EE, PhD  https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=OL9mr599hb0 

I am aware of the study of 300 vaccine injured people suffering from an autoimmune/inflammatory 
syndrome induced by adjuvants https://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/m/pubmed/28741088

I am aware that since the 1950s, various vaccines have been tainted with viruses (Simbian SV40 
Monkey Virus) and other cancer causing agents. http://www.tomgrimshaw.com/tomsblog/wp-
admin/post.php?post=25783

I am aware of the research done by arguably the world’s top immunologist, Hugh Fudenberg, MD, 
and 13th most quoted biologist of our times (nearly 850 papers in peer review journals): 
“If an individual has had 5 consecutive flu shots between 1970 and 1980 (the years studied) his/her 
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chances of getting Alzheimer's Disease is 10 times higher than if he/she had one, 2 or no shots.”

Dr. Fudenberg said it was due to mercury and aluminium that is in every flu shot. The gradual 
mercury and aluminium buildup in the brain causes cognitive dysfunction. Flu shots contain 25 
micrograms of mercury. One microgram is considered toxic.

Hugh Fudenberg, MD, is Founder and Director of Research, Neuro lmmuno Therapeutic Research 
Foundation. Information from Dr. Hugh Fudenberg came from transcribed notes of Dr. Fudenberg's 
speech at the NVIC International Vaccine Conference, Arlington, VA September, 1997. Quoted with
permission at: http://www.royalrife.com/flu_shots.html

I am aware that many medical professionals have done considerable research into vaccines have 
found them to be unsafe and ineffective: http://www.tomgrimshaw.com/tomsblog/?p=18404

I am aware that recently, 6 doctors had discovered that vaccines contain the protein Nagalase which 
interferes with an important protein in the body that eliminates cancer cells GcMAF (globulin part 
macrophage triggering aspect). I am further aware that each of these 6 doctors died within a short 
space of time all from foul play under suspicious circumstances although no connection can be 
proven. http://woked.co/doctors-cancer-enzymes-vaccines-murdered/ 

I am aware that the Italian vaccine research and advocacy organization Corvelva recently released 
new data regarding the use of aborted fetal cell lines in vaccines. 

The Corvelva team summarized their findings as follows:
1. The fetal cell line was found to belong to a male fetus.
2. The cell line presents itself in such a way that it is likely to be very old, thus consistent with the 
declared line of the 1960s.
3. The fetal human DNA represented in this vaccine is a complete individual genome, that is, the 
genomic DNA of all the chromosomes of an individual is present in the vaccine.
4. The human genomic DNA contained in this vaccine is clearly, undoubtedly abnormal, presenting 
important inconsistencies with a typical human genome, that is, with that of a healthy individual.
5. 560 genes known to be associated with forms of cancer were tested and all underwent major 
modifications.
6. There are variations whose consequences are not even known, not yet appearing in the literature, 
but which still affect genes involved in the induction of human cancer.
7. What is also clearly abnormal is the genome excess showing changes in the number of copies and
structural variants.

“Our results greatly reinforce the experimental observations of Dr. Theresa Deisher and especially 
the fact that the contaminant fetal DNA present in all samples analyzed in varying quantities (thus 
uncontrolled) is up to 300 times higher than the limit imposed by the EMA for carcinogenic DNA 
(10 ng/dose, corresponding to DNA contained in approximately 1000 tumor cells, derived from a 
statistical calculation, while the precautionary limit is 10 pg/dose), a limit that must also be applied 
to MRC-5 fetal DNA which inevitably contaminates Priorix tetra. As a consequence, this vaccine 
should be considered defective and potentially dangerous to human health, in particular to the 
pediatric population which is much more vulnerable to genetic and autoimmune damage.”
https://childrenshealthdefense.org/news/new-data-shows-aborted-fetal-cells-in-vaccines/ 

I am aware that independent tests of vaccines reveal toxic contaminants in all human vaccines 
tested: “Researchers examining 44 samples of 30 different vaccines found dangerous contaminants, 
including red blood cells in one vaccine and metal toxicants in every single sample tested – except 
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in one animal vaccine.” https://medicalveritas.org/dirty-vaccines-new-study-reveals-prevalence-of-
contaminants/ 

And subsequent to this research, The U.S. Food and Drug Administration (FDA) has published the 
results of an eye-opening investigation which found that the cellular matter used in the manufacture 
of many childhood vaccines is often contaminated with serious disease-causing viruses. FDA 
researcher admits viral cells in vaccines may “activate” genes and spread more disease:
https://www.fda.gov/vaccines-blood-biologics/biologics-research-projects/investigating-viruses-
cells-used-make-vaccines-and-evaluating-potential-threat-posed-transmission

VACCINES ARE UNSAFE AND CAUSE HARM
I am aware that the man who started this vaccine process, Edward Jenner, used his son as a test 
subject for his vaccine experiments. The son died at age 21 from tuberculosis, which has been 
linked to the smallpox vaccine.

I am aware that contrary to the vaccines subsequently being touted as safe and effective, in 2010 the
Supreme Court of the USA ruled vaccines "unavoidable unsafe".  
https://www.supremecourt.gov/opinions/10pdf/09-152.pdf 

I am aware that there is a widespread cover up in the medical industry of vaccine caused injuries 
and deaths thus making objective risk assessment impossible. For instance in Canada it is not 
possible to report a vaccine reaction as the cause of death on the death certificate and in the 2019 
Samoan mass immunisation, adults who died within days of receiving the mandated measles shot 
are recorded as dying from pneumonia, despite not have coughed at all.

I am aware of the Vaccine Adverse Events Recording System database that lists thousands of 
adverse events from vaccines from fever all the way through to encephalitis, paralysis and death. I 
am aware that according to medical authorities as few as 1 in 10 adverse events are recorded in 
VAERS as many health industry workers do not know of the database or are reluctant to assign 
vaccines as contributing to a negative health outcome.

I am aware that this makes accurate evaluation of the comparative risks of vaccines versus the 
infection/disease against which they are promoted to protect impossible to conduct.

I am aware that the US Congress was lobbied by vaccine makers to exempt them from any liability 
from harm caused by vaccines and that those parents whose children were killed or harmed by 
vaccines were to apply to the Childhood Vaccine Injury Compensation Tribunal seeking damages. I 
am aware that, despite the restrictive time frame during which claims can be filed and the fact that 
only 1 in 5 claims receives compensation, that body has to date paid out over 4 Billion dollars in 
damages to parents.

I have read the CDC study that shows a 1.8 times increase in neurodegenerative diseases, a 5 fold 
increase in sleeping disorders and a 6.8 fold increase in autism to vaccinated versus unvaccinated 
children. https://drive.google.com/file/d/1DD9uH_LkbqJssArd9vsDiatjs0PsVhY7/edit 
(Or: https://www.tomgrimshaw.com/Vaxxed-Unvaxxed-Full-Presentation-Parts-I-VI.pdf

I am aware that the claim that vaccines do not cause autism is a marketing lie and as well as the 
CDC whistle blower Dr Thompson exposing documents proving the CDC knew of this and covered
it up, in fact both an Italian court: 
https://newspunch.com/italian-court-rules-vaccines-do-cause-autism/ 
and the US Vaccine Injury Compensation Tribunal: 
https://ahrp.org/federal-court-compensated-83-vaccine-injured-autistic-children/ 
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have paid compensation for vaccine induced autism and that Dr Andrew Wakefield, who first 
reported the possible link between the MMR and autism, has since had 28 independent studies 
published supporting his research: http://www.tomgrimshaw.com/tomsblog/?p=22716

I am aware that many scientists have established the connection between nerve and brain damage 
and vaccines. 

I am aware that encephalitis is a possible complication from the measles virus. I am also aware from
reading the vaccine inserts and studying the VAERS database entries that encephalitis can also be 
caused by the measles vaccine.

I am aware that Merck are presently being sued by two ex-employee whistle blowers over their 
claims that they faked the efficacy results of the MMR vaccine and other wrong doings: 
https://www.huffingtonpost.ca/lawrence-solomon/merck-whistleblowers_b_5881914.html 

I am aware that Brandy Vaughan, formerly a Merck rep, left Merck when she learned the truth 
about the company’s lack of ethics regarding Vioxx. She left the company and when she also 
learned the truth about now vaccines now heads Learn The Risk.
https://althealthworks.com/9469/vaccines-are-not-for-public-health-former-merck-sales-rep-
revealsyelena/

I am aware of the 2011 health study funded by the US Dept of Health and Human Services which 
revealed that 54% or American children have one or more chronic health conditions, up from 10# In
the 1960s. Something is making children sicker. https://www.youtube.com/watch?
v=0OdOH2LSaHE And this generation of children are predicted to be the first in a long while who 
are, on average, unlikely to outlive their parents.

I have watched the film VAXXED and am fully aware of the negligence and misconduct 
surrounding the manufacture and promotion of vaccines.

I am aware of Dr Archie Kalokerinos. Dr Archie was a medical doctor in Australia, whose heart lay 
heavy with the huge problems he saw in the Aboriginal community. 50% of babies died as a result 
of receiving a measles vaccination. By not vaccinating them and implementing a simple protocol of 
Vitamins A and C, measles problems disappeared but that caused major issues for the establishment.
His efforts to solve these problems both medically and politically earned him innumerable enemies 
both medically and politically and the resultant fallout plagued his career to the point where 
attorneys were heavily pressured never to defend him. To their credit, high positioned lawyers put 
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their ethics above expediency, There was always someone willing to defend Dr Archie, despite the 
price they paid in their legal careers. For the whole of his life, what he saw and the way in which he 
was obstructed, weighed heavily on him because he knew that the medical issues he was discussing 
would apply worldwide and not just in Australia. He grieved that the medical system refused to see 
that his core work was the answer to so many problems were seeing. This remains true today. This 
is a video of him presenting. https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=755qCom6Jqo 
I am aware of the KIGGS study that show unvaccinated children have far fewer health issues and 
are overall far healthier than vaccinated children. (Graph from that study reproduced here for your 
convenience. The original can be viewed at: https://healthimpactnews.com/2011/new-study-
vaccinated-children-have-2-to-5-times-more-diseases-and-disorders-than-unvaccinated-children/ )

I am aware that prior to the introduction of vaccines that autism was almost unheard of. I am aware 
that relative to the increase in the number of vaccines to the standard schedule, autism rates have 
increased to the point where in the US now the rate amongst the vaccinated is 1 in 38 children.

I am aware that among the Amish who mostly do not vaccinate, autism is extremely rare. In fact the
only person this reporter found when he went looking was someone who regressed immediately 
after being vaccinated: http://whale.to/vaccine/olmsted.html 

I am aware that study published in Ebiomedicine by researchers Søren Wengel Mogensen and 
associates examined mortality rates of infants between the ages of 3 and 5 months who were given 
early vaccinations for DTP (Diptheria-Tetanus-Pertussis) and OPV (Oral Polio Vaccine) suffered a 
5-fold infant mortality rate compared to infants who were not given the vaccine. 
https://themindunleashed.com/2017/03/new-study-infant-mortality-doubles-dtp-vaccine.html 
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I am aware of the New Zealand study that shows unvaccinated children to be healthier than 
vaccinated children. https://www.tomgrimshaw.com/ias1992study.pdf
I am aware of the study published in 2017 in the Journal of Translational Science showing 
unvaccinated children vastly more healthy than vaccinated children.

I am aware that an English doctor was charged the General Medical Council by with malpractice for
testifying that children did not need vaccines to be healthy. I am aware that after a lengthy court 
case, the doctor was totally vindicated, proving to the court and the General Medical Council that 
vaccines are not necessary to achieve health. http://www.tomgrimshaw.com/tomsblog/?p=24878 

I am aware that in 2000, the US Centers for Disease Control (CDC) carried out a secret mission to 
bury, skew, and manipulate data in six vaccine safety studies, in a coordinated effort to control the 
message that “vaccines do not cause autism.” They did so via secret meetings and backtesting 
health-care data. The CDC invested tens of millions of dollars in a foreign health-care data analytics
startup run by Danish scientist Poul Thorsen, a move to ensure that no link ever surfaced. But fate 
had other ideas. The agency soon learned it couldn’t control Thorsen. In 2011, the US Justice 
Department indicted him for the theft of more than $1 million of CDC grant money.
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Master Manipulator exposes the CDC’s hidden agenda for the cover-up. Influenced by Big Pharma 
money, future high-paying jobs, and political lobbyists, CDC executives charted a course different 
than what the findings of earlier vaccine safety studies revealed. The CDC needed an outsider to 
“flatten” the results of the data, while building an exit strategy: a fall guy in case the secret plan was
exposed. Thorsen fit the bill nicely, conducting studies overseas. But the CDC’s plan backfired, as 
Thorsen took the money to the bank and the power went to his head. It would take years for his 
fraud scheme—funneling CDC grant money to a Danish university and then back to a CDC bank 
account he controlled—to play out.

Master Manipulator is a true story of fraud and betrayal. It’s a cautionary tale of the dangers of 
blind trust in the government and the health-care industry. 
https://www.amazon.com/dp/151070843X/ref=cm_sw_r_fa_dp_U_bEcbEbX0CYYEW 

VACCINES DO NOT CONFER IMMUNITY
I am aware that despite drug company claims to the contrary, vaccines are also not effective in 
conferring immunity and in fact can cause the disease they are supposed to be preventing. 

Case 1. In Dec 2019 a school with a 100% vaccination rate against pertussis closed due to the 
number of students with whooping cough: https://www.precisionvaccinations.com/st
%C2%A0theresa-school-houston-texas-closes-reduce-pertussis-outbreak
 
Case 2. More paralysis now occurs due to the Polio vaccine than occurs in the wild: 
https://medicalxpress.com/news/2019-11-polio-cases-vaccine-wild-virus.html 

Case 3. In 2019 25 vaccinated sailors and marines aboard the USS Fort McHenry came down with 
mumps, forcing the ship to be quarantined at sea: https://www.stripes.com/viral-infection-on-uss-
fort-mchenry-sickens-25-sailors-marines-1.572711

ANTIBODIES NOT IMPERATIVE FOR IMMUNITY
I am aware of the 2012 study which turned upside down the well established theory that antibodies 
are required for antiviral immunity by revealing an unexpected partnership between the specific and
non-specific divisions of the immune system is critical for fighting some types of viral infections. 
The research may lead to a new understanding of the best way to help protect those exposed to 
potentially lethal viruses, such as the rabies virus. 
https://www.sciencedaily.com/releases/2012/03/120301143426.htm

WEAPONISATION OF VACCINES

I have heard it said that man's worst ability is the ability to confront evil. The following may be too 
much to confront for some people. Some will disbelieve it because it is so different from they way 
they think. This is unfortunate because there are people in the world who do evil things. You only 
need to read a little of last century’s history to confirm that. Nigh on 100 million people were 
deliberately of accidentally (through poor planning) killed by their own governments. Unless we 
confront the evil and their actions and take measures to neutralise them, we will end up being the 
adverse effects of their evil. That is not an outcome I desire for thee and me.

AIDS And The Special Virus Cancer Program
'After World War II, it was discovered that the Nazis had been experimenting with the Visna virus. 
Visna is a disease that destroyed much of the sheep population of Iceland in the early 1930s. To 
isolate the virus, they first went to Iceland and dug up the long dead and frozen sheep. After the 
war, many German scientists came to America under Operation Paperclip and continued their work. 
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The American space program was initiated in this manner. February 12, 1962, saw the birth of 
America's "Special Virus Program.” In 1969, biological warfare expert Donald M. MacArthur 
predicted that a biological agent would be developed within the decade, that would destroy its 
victim's immune system.

On June 9, 1969, at a House Appropriations hearing, the Defense Department's Biological Warfare 
Division requested funds to create this new biological disease, the "Special Virus.” It was stated that
the new weapon would be a disease created by splicing certain genes and would affect the victim's 
immune system. It was stated that they were five to ten years from project completion. The funds 
were approved.

On July 18, President Nixon sent a secret memo to Congress entitled "Special Message to Congress 
on Problems of Population Growth" regarding an "urgent overpopulation" problem. March 16, 
1970, President Nixon signed Public Law 91-213 into effect. Here we are told that the population 
growth of the third world is seen as a threat to U.S. investment opportunities. It was then 
documented that a solution "To Stabilize World Population" would be sought. John D. Rockefeller 
III was called to be chairman of the Commission. This same issue of population control is 
emphasized in Nixon's July 18, 1969, "Message to Congress on Population" and House Resolution 
15090, part IV. page 129 makes mention of a mysterious "Synthetic Biological Agent."

In 1971, Dr. Robert Gallo wrote a paper on the "Special Virus”, titled "Reverse Transcriptase of 
Type-C Virus Particles of Human Origin", in which he reveals he was working on behalf of the U.S.
government to create a virus that would negatively impact the defense systems of the human 
immune system. We are told that, as part of the program, the Visna virus, a form of wasting disease 
the Nazis found in Icelandic sheep, was spliced into another to create this Special Virus particle.

In 1972, the World Health Organization (WHO) stated that: "An attempt should be made to 
ascertain whether viruses can in fact exert selective effects on immune function. By depressing 7S 
vs. 19S antibody or effecting T-cell as opposed to B-cell function... the possibility should be looked 
into that the immune response to the virus may itself be impaired if the effective viruses damage 
more or less selectively the cells responding to the viral antigens." - Bulletin of the WHO, vol.47. 
pg. 257- 274.

In 1974 we saw the American government release "NSM-200 U.S. Plan to Address Over 
Population." It was the sole topic of discussion at the World Population Conference held in 
Bucharest Romania later that year. In 1975, President Gerald Ford signed National Security Defense
Memorandum #314 (NSDM#34). This gave official U.S. approval for the enactment of Kissinger's 
NSSM-200 depopulation program.

An experimental hepatitis B vaccine ("Lot#751"), made by Merck and Co. Inc, was tested 
exclusively on homosexual men in Manhattan beginning in 1978. Soon after, the vaccine was also 
tested on the same population in Los Angeles and San Francisco. These tests were overseen by Dr. 
Wolf Szmuness who was working for the Centre for Disease Control (CDC), testing lasted until 
1981.

In 1984, Dr. Robert Gallo filed a patent application for the invention of the HIV/AIDS virus. U.S. 
patent number 4647773. https://patents.google.com/patent/US4647773A/en In order to patent a 
biological organism it would have to have been genetically modified or engineered. Over the next 
five to ten years, the world saw the outbreak of the AIDS virus; the epicenter being among 
Manhattan's, Los Angeles' and San Francisco's gay populations. Coincidentally, the exact same 
people who received the hepatitis B vaccine were the first AIDS victims.



The 1984 “discovery” of AIDS was announced by Dr. Robert Gallo of the National Cancer Institute,
which is located on the grounds of Fort Detrick, Maryland. This is the main U.S. Army biological 
weapons research facility. His paper announcing the discovery was nearly word for word identical 
to his earlier 1971 paper which told of his search for the "Special Virus." This announcement made 
Gallo the most famous virologist in the world. In Vol. 27 of Science, on pages 173-177, Dr. Robert 
Gallo announced that HIV/AIDS in fact “evolved from Visna" and has the exact genetic sequences. 
Despite this, the world has been told that the virus came from infected monkeys in Africa. If 
HIV/AIDS came from African monkeys, we must ask how they got it from long dead Icelandic 
sheep? The world is told that AIDS is the first primate virus to "jump species”, to cross from 
monkey to man. It was also discovered that the incidence of AIDS infections in Africa coincided 
exactly with the locations of the WHO smallpox vaccination program. The London Times. May 
11m 1987, ran a headline for an article by Pearce Wright, Science Editor, which read "Smallpox 
Vaccine Triggered AIDS Virus.”

In 1999, Dr. Boyd E. Graves, himself an HIV patient, was researching AIDS when he found a 
document that seems to prove that the American government invented the disease as a biological 
weapon. The document is a five-page fold out flowchart that was originally page 61 of a volume 
called "the Special Virus Cancer Programs, a division of United States' bio-wcaponry, 1971 
Progress Report #8." The flow chart links together fifteen animal reports, 20.000 scientific papers 
and numerous contracts. The objective of the flowchart was the creation of a “contagious cancer 
virus" that would attack the immune system, exactly what HIV/AIDS is. With this knowledge, 
Graves filed suit against the United States for the “creation, production and proliferation of AIDS" 
on September 28, 1998. Both the lower court and the appeals court dismissed the case as 
“frivolous". Graves has since written of his work in his book State Origin: the Evidence of the 
Laboratory Birth of AIDS, in which he discloses hundreds of other incriminating government 
documents.

The American government spent $550 million to develop the "Special Virus". Despite calls to 
account for the money and release information about this virus, they have refused. According to Dr. 
Graves. 15.000 gallons of the AIDS virus was ready in 1977. From that point it was distributed to 
Africa disguised as a small pox vaccine and then in Manhattan, distributed as a hepatitis B vaccine 
for gay men. Blacks and gays: two of the most discriminated against groups in the 1970-80's. 
Startlingly, the AIDS virus is ethno-selectivc, infecting twice as many Blacks, Latinos and Native 
Americans as whites, with death coming three times as swiftly. On April 20, 2000, the Washington 
Post reported that 16 million people had died from AIDS since 1980. Sixty percent of the dead are 
sub-Saharan Africans and in the United States more than 80% of those killed by AIDS have been 
African Americans.

With the heat on him, in 2001 Dr. Gallo admitted he was the "Project Officer" for the federal virus 
development program, aka the “Special Virus.” He said his work was on a primate study contracted 
by Litton Bionetics that combined cancers and viruses in baby macaque monkeys. Few understand 
that AIDS is a form of cancer and fewer yet understand the relation between cancers and viruses.

The Washington Times reported on September 21, 2003, that “Some of the Polio Vaccine given to 
millions of American children from 1962 until 2000 could have been contaminated with a monkey 
virus that shows up in some cancers, according to documents and testimony to be delivered to a 
House committee Wednesday." This cancerous monkey virus, known as SV40, was injected into 
millions of North American children between 1962-2000. This generation now has the highest 
incidence of cancer, an extremely expensive disease to treat.

AIDS was created to kill millions of people. The Luciferian elite made themselves judge, jury and 
executioner. The victim's supposed crimes? Mere existence. Consider that public heath clinics 



continue to attract mainly poor and marginalized minority groups for free immunizations and 
vaccines. For these reasons we should be wary of mandatory vaccination programs that just don't 
make sense. In 1998 President Bill Clinton enacted legislation that 12 hour old infants receive a 
series of three vaccinations against Hep B. Why? The fact is that 96% of those infected with Hep B 
never become seriously ill, instead they develop life long immunity and are never contagious. It is 
also known that those receiving this vaccination would supposedly lose their immunity by their 
teenage years.

Recently the Western world has been introduced to Gardasil, another vaccine given to females of 
childbearing age. This one to immunize against HPV caused cervical cancers. Gardasil is made by 
Merck, the same company that brought the experimental Hep B vaccine to American gays. It should
also be known that Merck Pharmaceutical Company's president, George W. Merck, was head of 
America’s biological weapons industry during the Cold War.

In February 2009, the H5N1 Bird Flu' virus, a level three biological weapon, was discovered in 
Baxter's flu shot vaccine, destined for public usage in Europe. It was reported in the March 6 issue 
of the Times of India and in many other publications, such as the Toronto Sun, but not at all in the 
U.S. Truly the nearest of misses, if the vaccine was released, the ensuing worldwide epidemic could
have killed 60% of earth's population! Scientists declared there was absolutely no way this could 
have been an accident! This is the story of the century and it’s practically a secret.'
https://www.bibliotecapleyades.net/sociopolitica/esp_sociopol_depopu40.htm

I am aware of the Tuskagee Experiment where, recruited by the promise of free medical care, 600 
men originally were enrolled in the project. In order to track the disease’s full progression, 
researchers provided no effective care as the men died, went blind or insane or experienced other 
severe health problems due to their untreated syphilis.

I am also aware that in 2010, President Barack Obama and other federal officials apologised for 
another unethical, U.S.-sponsored medical study, conducted decades earlier in Guatemala. In that 
study, from 1946 to 1948, nearly 700 men and women—prisoners, soldiers, mental patients—were 
intentionally infected with syphilis (hundreds more people were exposed to other sexually 
transmitted diseases as part of the study) without their knowledge or consent. The purpose of the 
study was to determine whether penicillin could prevent, not just cure, syphilis infection. Some of 
those who became infected never received medical treatment.
https://www.history.com/news/the-infamous-40-year-tuskegee-study 

I am aware that 500,000 Kenyan girls were sterilised ‘due to contamination’ in the tetanus vaccine:
“Today, we can confirm… ...Hundreds of thousands of our girls and women, aged between 14 and 
49, from the fastest growing populations in the country will not have children, because of the state-
sponsored sterilization that was sold to the country as tetanus vaccination,” he declared. 

“These results all indicate that the Tetanus Toxoid Vaccine had high contents of beta human 
chorionic gonadotropin hormone (BhCG) that causes sterility in women.” 
http://apanews.net/en/pays/kenya/news/kenya-thousands-infertile-after-govt-sponsored-vaccination-
odinga 

I am aware that in 2009 live Avian Flu Virus was present in a Baxter produced vaccine sent to 18 
countries. I am aware of the claims by health professionals that there is no way possible for this to 
have been accidental given the procedural safeguards in the handling of live virii. 
http://www.physiciansforlife.org/live-avian-flu-virus-placed-in-baxter-vaccine-materials-sent-to-18-
countries-2009/

https://www.bibliotecapleyades.net/sociopolitica/esp_sociopol_depopu40.htm
http://www.physiciansforlife.org/live-avian-flu-virus-placed-in-baxter-vaccine-materials-sent-to-18-countries-2009/
http://www.physiciansforlife.org/live-avian-flu-virus-placed-in-baxter-vaccine-materials-sent-to-18-countries-2009/
http://apanews.net/en/pays/kenya/news/kenya-thousands-infertile-after-govt-sponsored-vaccination-odinga
http://apanews.net/en/pays/kenya/news/kenya-thousands-infertile-after-govt-sponsored-vaccination-odinga
https://www.history.com/news/the-infamous-40-year-tuskegee-study


I am aware not everyone has the best intentions of the rest of us in mind and that men in the past 
have done evil things on a massive scale killing tens of millions. This is some data on the potential 
liability of accepting any and all vaccines. 
https://thebridgelifeinthemix.info/health/who-memos-1972-explains-how-to-turn-vaccines-into-a-
means-of-killing/

Dr Tenpenny wrote: Copied from the WHO website dated Dec 9th 2019: "Whereas Smallpox NO 
LONGER OCCURS NATURALLY... ...the global health sector remains vigilant in the event it 
could reappear through natural mechanisms, laboratory accident or deliberate release."

Who can read between the lines and point out the source of the next outbreak? (There are only three
sources and they've told us that the first possibility no longer exists.)
https://www.who.int/news-room/fact-sheets/detail/monkeypox

In short, I am aware that vaccines are made by companies convicted of felony offences and 
despite claims to the contrary and as the above data amply demonstrates, vaccines 
are untested,
contain ingredients and contaminants toxic to the body and injurious to its health,
are not safe, 
cause harm,
are not effective,
and do not confer immunity
so are a huge gamble to those taking them, a medical experiment, if you will, the outcomes to 
which cannot even begin to be guessed at let alone predicted, as this article from 1992 shows:

https://www.who.int/news-room/fact-sheets/detail/monkeypox?fbclid=IwAR1r7ARms5EI1XnxF9vaITfYPcp_4xb8Jc79Ij_ctf7MsmAquPn33NsEcqQ
https://thebridgelifeinthemix.info/health/who-memos-1972-explains-how-to-turn-vaccines-into-a-means-of-killing/
https://thebridgelifeinthemix.info/health/who-memos-1972-explains-how-to-turn-vaccines-into-a-means-of-killing/


The article is fine for the first column and two paragraphs. Then it expresses “the official line” - 
because the vaccines did not work, the solution to the problem is more vaccines. Mind boggling!



I am aware that according to the Nuremberg Code (formulated as a response to the enforced 
medical treatment by German Nazis of their prisoners) experimental medical treatment should be 
informed and consensual. As the outcome from the application of a vaccine is not certain it must be 
considered experimental. I am going to administer this vaccination in violation of that principle.

As a result of my understanding of the above data and after reading and fully understanding the 
vaccine information sheet that accompanies this vaccine I am aware that this vaccine may cause any
number of wide-ranging and adverse health impacts from fever to permanent paralysis or death. 

I am aware that a blanket, one-size fits approach to individual health is inappropriate. 
I am competent in the area of assessing both normal and compromised immune systems. 
I have studied the vaccine insert for the vaccine I am about to administer. 
I have thoroughly and comprehensively examined the intended vaccine recipient.
I have arranged for such tests as are necessary to establish that the individual presents with no 
conditions or factors that would increase their risk of vaccine injury. 
I have fully documented the current state of health, nourishment level, immune response, 
behavioural and physical characteristics of the person who is to receive the vaccine.
I attest that there there are no factors present in the individual that would indicate that they are 
likely to suffer from the vaccine or that the vaccine to be administered is contraindicated.

I acknowledge that in administering this vaccine I am overriding the primary caregiver’s 
responsibility for the physical, mental and spiritual health of the person receiving the vaccine. I am 
aware that where there is risk there must be choice otherwise the enforced application of any 
medical procedure is medical tyranny, suppressive to the power of choice of the individual thus a 
violation of their human rights, a cause of stress and antipathetic to the mental and spiritual well 
being and survival of the recipient and their immediate family. As such, in administering this 
vaccine I am aware I am violating the primary principle of medicine, that is, “First, do no harm.”

I am prepared to waive my immunity from any and all claims for damages granted by existing or 
future legislation that exempts my liability for harm caused by the vaccine. 

I am willing to take full professional and personal liability for any harm the vaccine does to the 
person to whom it is administered and compensate them, their heirs or assigns.

By my signature below I attest to awareness of the above and that I am a health care professional 
duly authorised to administer vaccinations in the state of                                             in the country 
of                                         

Name of Person Receiving Coerced Medication _________________________________________

Date of Application of Enforced Medication        /          /    

Full Name of Person Administering Vaccine ____________________________________________

Signature of Person Administering Vaccine ____________________________________________

Full Name of Witness ______________________________________________________________

Signature of Witness _______________________________________________________________

Address of Witness ________________________________________________________________
https://www.tomgrimshaw.com/Vaccine_Data_Waiver_Medical.pdf V
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